
Eggnog Mix Carton

Simply add to milk to  
create an authentic- 
tasting eggnog. Great in 
milkshakes, smoothies 
or a Bundt cake recipe.

Makes 1 Quart.

12360-1  |  Cspk. 36

Campfire’s S’mores Hot  

Chocolate Drink Carton 

Mix

Bring the campfire home 
with our newest flavor. 
Each sip is a perfect 
blend of toasted marsh-
mallow, graham  
cracker and chocolate. 

Makes 1 Quart.

20048-3  |  Cspk. 24

Mexican Hot Chocolate 

Drink Mix Carton

A creative cocoa, with a 
kick! Carefully blended 
with classic spices, this 
Mexican-style beverage 
is perfect for any bold 
palette.

Makes 1 Quart.

20009-4  |  Cspk. 24

Original Mulling Spice 

Blend Carton

Our Original Cider  
Spice features the  
warm flavors of cinna-
mon and clove.

Makes 1 Gallon. 

12345-7  |  Cspk. 36 
12345-4  |  Cspk. 72

Original Mulling Spice 

Blend Single Packet

Our Original Cider Spice 
with its warm flavors of 
cinnamon and clove in a 
single-serve packet.

Makes 1 Serving.

12342-2  |  Cspk. 100

Cinnamon Orange 

Mulling Spice Blend 

Carton

Evoke the spirit of a 
crisp fall day with our 
Cinnamon Orange Spice 
Blend.

Makes 1 Gallon.

12355-7  |  Cspk. 36

Caramel Apple Mulling 

Spice Blend Carton

Rich caramel flavor 
blended with the taste of 
crisp apples makes for 
an absolutely delicious 
combination! 

Makes 1 Gallon.

12349-6  |  Cspk. 36

Sugar Free Original  

Mulling Spice Blend 

Carton

Our Sugar Free variety 
has the same flavors and 
qualities as the Original 
but with fewer calories.

Makes 1 Gallon.

12367-9  |  Cspk. 36

2021 Products

Milk Chocolate Hot  

Chocolate Drink Mix 

Carton

A seasonal classic, with 
Aspen flare! Enjoy the  
smooth flavor of creamy  
milk chocolate blended  
to perfection, with a 
touch of sweetness.

Makes 1 Quart.

20007-0  |  Cspk. 24
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